CITY OF NEW BEDFORD

In the Year Two Thousand and Twenty-Two

AN ORDINANCE

RELATIVE TO TAXI RATES

31 508
Be it ordained by the City Council of the City of New Bedford as follows:—

SECTION 1. .
Subparagraph 1 of Paragraph J of Section 24-8 of Chapter 24 of the Code of

Ordinances is hereby amended by striking the figure “$2.00” and inserting, in place thereof, the figure
“$2.50.”

SECTION 2. Subparagraph 2 of Paragraph J of Section 24-8 of Chapter 24 of the Code of
Ordinances is hereby amended by striking the figure “$0.35” and inserting, in place thereof;, the figure
“$0.40”

SECTION 3. Subparagraph 3 of Paragraph J of Section 24-8 of Chapter 24 of the Code of
Ordinances is hereby amended by striking the dollar figure “$0.35” and inserting, in place thereof, the
figure “$0.40

SECTION 4. This Ordinance shall take effect in accordance with the provisions of Chapter 43 of
the General Laws.




